
COMMITTEE OF THE WHOLE 

Monday, July 21, 2025 
immediately following the City Council Meeting at 7pm 

City Hall Council Chamber 
109 James Street 
Geneva, IL 60134 

Ald. Mark Reinecke, Chair 

AGENDA 

1. Call to Order

2. Approve Committee of the Whole Minutes from July 7, 2025.

3. Items of Business

a. Consider Draft Resolution Authorizing the City Administrator to Execute a Contract with Era-
Valdivia Contractors, Inc. for a total not-to-exceed amount of $445,500 for Kirk Road Water
Tower Painting.

b. Consider Draft Resolution Authorizing Execution of a Service Agreement with
All City Management for Crossing Guard Services.

4. Public Comment

When recognized by the Chair, proceed to the podium, state your name for the record, and
provide your public comments. Please understand this is your time to be heard and the public
body’s time to listen. No discussion or debate will follow.

5. New Business

6. Closed Session on the appointment, employment, compensation, discipline, performance, or
dismissal of specific employees of the public body (5 ILCS 120/2(c)(1)

7. Adjournment

ADA Compliance:  Any individual with a disability requesting a reasonable accommodation in order to 
participate in a public meeting should contact the City at least 48 hours in advance of the scheduled 
meeting. The City can be reached in person at 22 S First Street, Geneva, IL, or by telephone at (630) 232-
7494. Every effort will be made to allow for meeting participation. Notice of this meeting was posted 
consistent with the requirements of 5 ILCS 120/1 et seq. (Open Meetings Act). 
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GENEVA COMMITTEE OF THE WHOLE MEETING MINUTES 
Monday, July 7, 2025 

City Hall Council Chambers 
109 James St., Geneva, IL 60134 

Elected Officials Present: Mayor Burns, Ald. Bowring, Ald. Furnish, Ald. Kilburg, 
Ald. Kosirog, Ald. Malecki, Ald. Marks. Ald. Mayer, Ald. Palmquist, Ald. 
Paschke, Ald. Reinecke, Clerk Kellick. 

Elected Officials Attending by Teleconference: None. 

Elected Officials Absent: None. 

Others Present: City Admin. Dawkins, City Asst. Admin. McCready, City Attny. 
Sandack, Supt. Holton, Supt. Javed, Supt. Van Gyseghem, Dir. Babica, Dir. 
DeGroot, Dir. Milewski, Dir. Tymoszenko, Asst. Dir. Landers, Chief Passarelli. 

Others attending by video or teleconference: None. 

Call to Order 
Ald. Furnish, serving as chair, called the meeting to order at 7:38 PM noting all 
council members were present. 

Approve Committee of the Whole Minutes from June 16, 2025, Special 
Committee of the Whole Minutes from May 12, 2025, and Special Committee 
of the Whole Minutes from June 23, 2025 
Moved by Ald. Kosirog, seconded by Ald. Palmquist. 
MOTION CARRIED by voice vote 10-0. 

Items of Business 
Consider Draft Resolution Authorizing an Agreement with All City Management 
for Crossing Guard Services. 
Moved by Ald. Kilburg, seconded by Ald. Kosirog. 

On a question by Ald. Paschke, Chief Passarelli stated that guards work 30 minutes 
each morning and evening, five days a week. The goal of the department is for new 
hires to be independent contractors. All City Management would pay $23.50 per 
hour instead of the current $22.50 per hour. 
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On a question by Ald. Bowring, Chief Passarelli answered that there is only one 
alternate because advertising for the position resulted in no applicants. Ald. 
Bowring stated that increasing compensation may help to increase recruitment. 
Admin. Dawkins noted while recruitment is one driving factor the process of 
contracting out for crossing guards began in 2010, with the goal to eventually 
contract all the work out to transfer liability and risk management to a third party. 

On a question by Ald. Malecki, Admin. Dawkins stated that school districts have 
traditionally declined to pay for crossing guards when asked. 

Several Alderpersons expressed that a higher salary may attract more applicants. 

Moved by Ald. Marks, seconded by Ald. Paschke to postpone discussion to the 
July 21 Committee of the Whole meeting. 

On a question by Ald. Bowring, Chief Passarelli stated that the City would retain 
the current crossing guards and that the goal was to have the transition in place by 
the school year on August 22. 
Roll call: 

AYES: 9 (Bowring, Furnish, Kilburg, Malecki, Marks, Mayer, Palmquist, Paschke, 
Reinecke) 
ABSENT: 0 
NAYS: 1 (Kosirog) 
MOTION CARRIED 

Approve Resolution Authorizing an Economic Incentive Agreement by and 
Between the City of Geneva and Nick and Jim Nicolaou for 427 and 421 E. State 
Street – Honeybird. 
Moved by Ald. Paschke, seconded by Ald. Kilburg. 
MOTION CARRIED by voice vote 10-0. 
Consider Draft Resolution Authorizing the Execution of a Contract with Vons 
Electric, Inc. in the Amount of $235,825.00 for Replacement Generator at the 
Police Department. 
Moved by Ald. Marks, seconded by Ald. Bowring. 

On a question by Ald. Kosirog, Admin. Dawkins stated that the generator could be 
moved or installed elsewhere if needed. 
MOTION CARRIED by voice vote 10-0. 
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Consider Draft Resolution Authorizing the Execution of a Professional Services 
Agreement with Bodwe WBK Engineering to Provide Construction Oversight for 
Public Improvements. 
Moved by Ald. Bowring, seconded by Ald. Kosirog. 
MOTION CARRIED by voice vote 10-0. 
 
Consider Draft Resolution Authorizing the Execution of a Memorandum of 
Agreement with MIF Geneva Park-J, LLC and MIF Geneva Park-M, LLC to 
Extend Watermain Improvements in Accordance with the Pipeline Crossing 
Agreement Dated December 20, 2021. 
Moved by Ald. Bowring, seconded by Ald. Paschke. 
MOTION CARRIED by voice vote 10-0. 
 
Consider Draft Resolution Authorizing Approval of a Proposal from Associated 
Technical Services Ltd. for a Water System Leak Detection & Location Survey in 
an Amount Not-to-Exceed $35,000.00. 
Moved by Ald. Paschke, seconded by Ald. Marks. 
 
On a question by Ald. Malecki, Supt. Van Gyseghem stated that if a leak occurs on 
the homeowner’s property, a letter is sent to the owner notifying them that they 
have 30 days to correct the leak. On another question, Supt. Van Gyseghem noted 
that acoustical testing is used to detect leaks. 
MOTION CARRIED by voice vote 10-0. 
 
Consider Draft Resolution Authorizing the Purchase of a 2026 John Deere 624P 
4WD Loader from West Side Tractor in an Amount Not to Exceed $273,062.26. 
Moved by Ald. Bowring, seconded by Ald. Paschke. 
MOTION CARRIED by voice vote 10-0. 
 
Consider Draft Resolution Authorizing the Purchase of a Falcon 3-Ton Asphalt 
Recycler and Hot Box Trailer from Midwest Paving Equipment, Inc. 
Moved by Ald. Marks, seconded by Ald. Paschke. 
MOTION CARRIED by voice vote 10-0. 
 
Public Comment 
Resident Elaine Haughan noted that she would like to see wind phones installed in 
Geneva. She explained that a wind phone is a symbolic tool for dealing with grief 
in which a tactile non-working phone is installed in nature and mounted to a bench 
or post in the community. One can dial a loved one’s number to talk. The concept 
began in Japan by a gardener after the 2011 tsunami which helped community 
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members with their grief. Ms. Haughan explained that her son passed away at age 
18. She now has over 12 people working with her on this idea for the community.

Admin. McCready passed out postcards to City Council members and stated that 
SPAC chair Melanie Mannon would be reaching out to council members about 
SPAC’s annual community update event to be held July 29 at the library. He asked 
that councilmembers pass out the cards to anyone wanting to learn more about the 
strategic plan. 

New Business 
None.  

Adjournment 
On a motion by Ald. Mayer, the meeting was adjourned by unanimous voice vote 
at 8:38 PM. 

‐ Submitted by Clerk Kellick 
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AGENDA ITEM EXECUTIVE SUMMARY 

Agenda Item: Kirk Road Water Tower Painting 

Presenter & Title: Bob Van Gyseghem, Superintendent of Water & Wastewater 

Date: August 4, 2025 
Please Check Appropriate Box: 

☒ Committee of the Whole Meeting ☐ Special Committee of the Whole Meeting 
☒ City Council Meeting ☐ Special City Council Meeting 
☐ Public Hearing ☐ Other - 

Associated Strategic Plan Goal/Objective: QIS-1 

Estimated Cost: $405,000.00 Budgeted?    ☒ Yes 
☐ No

Other           ☐ Yes
Funding?     ☐ No 

Executive Summary: 
Painting of the Kirk Road Water Tower is included in the FY26 budget. The project was advertised in the Daily 
Herald and the City website. Nine bids were received. After review of the bid submittals by Fehr Graham 
Engineering, the recommendation is to award the contract to Era-Valdivia Contractors, Inc. Chicago, IL. The first 
three low bidders had a combination of problems with the bid documents submitted including being disbarred 
from working in Illinois by the Illinois Department of Labor, unsigned and missing bid documents, and no history 
of working in Illinois. Staff concurs with the recommendation by Fehr Graham. The bid by Era-Valdivia of 
$405,000.00 is below the budgeted amount of $700,000. In comparison, the Dodson St. Water Tower, which is 
the same size as the Kirk Rd. Water Tower, was repainted in 2020 at a cost of $579,991.00.  A 10% contingency is 
recommended to be included in the overall not-to-exceed amount to account for any unforeseen field changes that 
may occur. Any field changes (Change Orders) must be approved by the City Administrator to be applied to the 
contingency. The tower will be sandblasted and painted with the same colors and logo that was applied to the 
Dodson St. Water Tower. 
Attachments: (please list) 
• Engineer's Recommendation
• Resolution
Voting Requirements: 
This motion requires a simple majority of affirmative votes for passage. (City Council Only) 
The Mayor may vote on three occasions: (a) when the vote of the alderpersons has resulted in a tie; (b) 
when one half of the alderpersons elected have voted in favor of an ordinance, resolution, or motion 
even though there is no tie vote; or (c) when a vote greater than a majority of the corporate authorities is 
required by state statute or local ordinance to adopt an ordinance, resolution, or motion. 
Recommendation / Suggested Action: (how the item should be listed on agenda) 
Recommend approval of  Resolution authorizing the City Administrator to Execute a Contract with Era-
Valdivia Contractors, Inc. for a total not-to-exceed amount of $445,500.00 
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230 Woodlawn Avenue I Aurora, IL 60506 I p:630.897.4651 I  fehrgraham.com  

Insight. Experience. Results. 

July 16, 2025 

Bob VanGyseghem 
Superintendent of Water & Wastewater 
City of Geneva 
22 South First Street 
Geneva, IL 60134 

RE: Kirk Road Water Tower Painting 
Bid Evaluation and Recommendation 

Dear Bob, 

Bids were opened for the Kirk Road Water Tower Painting project on July 14, 2025. Fehr Graham has 
reviewed the bids. Bids were received from nine bidders. The following is a summary of the bids: 

CONTRACTOR NAME 
BID PRICE 

(FALL 2025) 
ALTERNATE 

(SPRING 2026) 
Five12 Painting - Remodeling LLC $289,123.00 $304,123.00 
E&L Contractors, Inc. $372,000.00 NO BID 
Seven Brothers Painting, Inc. $384,300.00 $404,300.00 
Era-Valdivia Contractors, Inc. $405,000.00 $435,000.00 
Tecorp, Inc. NO BID $554,500.00 
Inspec Coatings, Inc. $600,000.00 $449,000.00 
Jetco, Ltd NO BID $692,061.00 
Maxcor, Inc. $749,868.00 $749,868.00 
Pittsburg Tank & Tower Co., Inc. $915,625.00 $853,125.00 

A tabulation of the first five bids is attached to this letter. The engineer’s estimate was $890,000. The 
lowest bid was 68% below the engineer’s estimate. The remaining bids were 58% lower to 3% higher 
than the engineer’s estimate.  

The two lowest bidders did not demonstrate similar experience in Illinois and/or submitted the 
incorrect bid form. These discrepancies led to the disqualification of their bids. The third-lowest 
bidder is debarred from participating in any public works project in Illinois for a period of four years, 
effective May 5, 2025.  

The fourth-lowest bidder is Era Valdivia Contractors, Inc. Fehr Graham believes Era-Valdivia 
Contractors, Inc.’s bid is reasonable, and they have an understanding of the scope of work. Fehr 
Graham recommends an award to ERA-Valdivia in an amount totaling $405,000 for construction in 
Fall 2025. 

Fehr Graham recommends that the City of Geneva award this project to the contractor at the next 
City Council meeting.  
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July 16, 2025 
Bob VanGyseghem, City of Geneva 
Kirk Road Water Tower Painting 
Page 2 

Thank you for this opportunity to serve the City. We look forward to the successful completion of this 
project. 

Very Truly Yours, 

Elisa P. Bonkowski, P.E. 

EPB:lar 

O:\Geneva, City of\25-725 Kirk Road Water Tower Painting\PA Final\Bid Review Letter-2025 -07-15_Geneva.docx 
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RESOLUTION NO. 2025- 

RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING EXECUTION OF 
Contract for Painting the Kirk Road Water Tower 

 BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF GENEVA, KANE 

COUNTY, ILLINOIS, as follows: 

SECTION 1:    That the City Administrator is hereby authorized to execute, on behalf of the 

City of Geneva, a contract with Era-Valdivia Contractors, Inc., related to the painting of the Kirk 

Road Water Tower in an amount not to exceed $445,500 inclusive of 10% contingency (see Exhibit 

A). 

SECTION 2:  This Resolution shall become effective from and after its passage as in 

accordance with law. 

PASSED by the City Council of the City of Geneva, Kane County, Illinois, this ____ day of 

_________, 2025 

AYES: __   NAYS: __  ABSENT: __   ABSTAINING: __      HOLDING OFFICE: __    

Approved by me this ____ day of __________, 2025. 

   Mayor 
ATTEST: 

City Clerk 
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BID TABULATION
City of Geneva, Illinois
Kirk Road Water Tower Painting
Project No. 25-725
July 14, 2025: 10:00 a.m. 773-721-9350

1 2 3 4 5
Five12 Painting & Remodeling LLC E&L Contractors, Inc. Seven Brothers Era-Valdivia Contractors Tecorp, Inc

DISBARRED IN ILLINOIS
Bid Security 5.2% 5% 5% 5% 5%
Total Base Bid (Fall 2025) 289,123.00$     372,000.00$     384,300.00$    405,000.00$    NO BID
Total Alternate (Spring 2026) 304,123.00$     NO BID 404,300.00$    435,000.00$    554,000.00$     
Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda   Did not use correct bid form   

Certifications
Affidavit of Experience  No similar projects in Illinois  No similar projects in Illinois  x  x  ILLINOIS 
Certification for Bid x x x x x
Certification of Compliance with Section 11-42.I-1 of the IL Municipal Code (no tax deliquency) (p.12)x x x x x
Certification for a Drug Free Workplace x x x x x
Certification of Compliance of ILCS Ch. 65, Sec 11-42.1 (p.24) x x not included x not included
Certification of Non-Disqualification under ILCS, Ch 720, Sec 33E-11 (p.25) x x not included x not included
Certificate of Compliance with Safety Standards x x  not included x not included
Performance Bond

Payment Bond

FEHR GRAHAM 1

Exhibit A
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AGENDA ITEM EXECUTIVE SUMMARY 

Agenda Item: Contract Crossing Guard Services with All City Management Services 

Presenter & Title: Chief of Police Eric M. Passarelli 

Date: July 21, 2025 
Please Check Appropriate Box: 
☒ Committee of the Whole Meeting ☐ Special Committee of the Whole Meeting 
☒ City Council Meeting ☐ Special City Council Meeting 
☐ Public Hearing ☐ Other - 
Associated Strategic Plan Goal/Objective: QIS-1 

Estimated Cost: $90,504.00 Budgeted?    ☒ Yes 
☐ No

Other           ☐ Yes
Funding?     ☒ No 

If “Other Funding,” please explain how the item will be funded: 
Executive Summary: 
The City of Geneva provides crossing guard services at six (6) crossings within our corporate 
limits. They are a combination of independent contractors and City of Geneva employees. There 
were 104 crossing guard absences last school year that resulted in required crossing coverage. 54 
of the absences were covered by community service officers or police officers. An RFP was 
utilized to obtain proposals for a 3rd party vendor to manage the program. This was done to 
assure community service officers and police officers were available for 911 calls for service and 
to mitigate liability for the City of Geneva. Two vendors submitted proposals. All City 
Management Services is recommended based upon the cost and the feedback of references. I 
personally spoke with representatives from Normal IL, Urbandale Iowa, and Lenexa Kansas. All 
references were very pleased with the work product provided by All City Management Services. 
Normal IL is presenting a three-year extension to their city council on 7/21. If the decision is 
made to not move forward with this proposal, we would recommend transitioning all current 
school crossing guards from independent contractors to employees of the city of Geneva. 
Attachments: (please list) 
• Bid Tab Sheet
• All City Management Proposal
• Resolution
• Draft Service Agreement

Voting Requirements: 
This motion requires a simple majority of affirmative votes for passage. (City Council Only) 

Recommendation / Suggested Action: (how the item should be listed on agenda) 
Consider Recommendation of Resolution Authorizing Execution of a Service Agreement with 
All City Management for Crossing Guard Services. 
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RESOLUTION NO. 2025_-__ 

RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING EXECUTION OF  
SERVICE AGREEMENT WITH ALL CITY MANAGEMENT SERVICES 

 BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF GENEVA, KANE 

COUNTY, ILLINOIS, as follows: 

SECTION 1:    That the City Administrator is hereby authorized to execute, on behalf of 

the City of Geneva, a Service Agreement, in substantially the same form as Exhibit A, with All 

City Management Services, relating to the providing of crossing guard services to the City of 

Geneva for the 2025-2026 school year. 

SECTION 2:  This Resolution shall become effective from and after its passage as in 

accordance with law. 

PASSED by the City Council of the City of Geneva, Kane County, Illinois, this ____ day of 

_________, 2025 

AYES: __   NAYS: __ ABSENT: __   ABSTAINING: __      HOLDING OFFICE: __    

Approved by me this ____ day of __________, 2025. 

Mayor 
ATTEST: 

City Clerk 
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AGREEMENT 

THIS AGREEMENT (“Agreement”) is made and entered into this day of 
, 20 , by and 

between the CITY OF GENEVA, an Illinois municipal corporation (hereinafter 
referred to as “CITY”) and  “CROSSING GUARD 
PROVIDER”). 

WHEREAS, the CITY desires to engage the CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER to furnish certain 
professional services in connection with CROSSING GUARD SERVICES (hereinafter referred to 
as the “AGREEMENT”); and 

WHEREAS, the CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER represents that it is in compliance 
with Illinois Statutes relating to professional registration of individuals and has the necessary 
expertise and experience to furnish such services upon the terms and conditions set forth herein 
below. 

NOW, THEREFORE, it is hereby agreed by and between the CITY and the CROSSING 
GUARD PROVIDER that the CITY does hereby retain the CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER 
for and in consideration of the mutual promises and covenants contained herein, the sufficiency 
of which is hereby acknowledged to perform the services relating to the AGREEMENT as 
described herein, subject to the following terms and conditions and stipulations, to-wit: 

1. SCOPE OF SERVICES

A. All work hereunder shall be performed under the direction of
the

  of the CITY, herein after referred to as the 
“CHIEF OF POLICE”. 

B. This section should be an outline of the services to be provided by the
CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER.

2. WORK PRODUCT

All work product prepared by the CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER pursuant hereto
including, but not limited to, reports, plans, designs, calculations, studies, photographs,
models and recommendations shall be the property of the CITY and shall be delivered
to the CITY upon request of the CHIEF OF POLICE; provided, however, that the
CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER may retain copies of such work product for its
records. CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER’s execution of this Agreement shall
constitute CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER’s conveyance and assignment of all right,
title and interest, including but not limited to any copyright interest, by the CROSSING
GUARD PROVIDER to the CITY of all such work product prepared by the CROSSING
GUARD PROVIDER pursuant to this Agreement. The CITY shall have the right either

Exhibit A
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on its own or through such other CROSSING GUARD PROVIDERs as determined by 
the CITY to utilize and/or amend such work product.  

3. PAYMENTS TO THE CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER (Not to Exceed Method)

A. For services provided the CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER shall be paid at the
rate of  times the direct hourly rate of personnel
employed on this AGREEMENT, with the total fee not to exceed

regardless of the actual costs incurred by the
CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER unless substantial modifications to the scope
of the work are authorized in writing by the CHIEF OF POLICE.

B. For outside services provided by other firms or subcontractors, the CITY shall
pay the CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER the invoiced fee to the CROSSING
GUARD PROVIDER, plus  .
The costs for any such outside services are included within the total not to exceed
amount provided for in paragraph 4A above.

C. List other components of the fee such as reimbursables. The costs of any such
reimbursable expenses are included within the total not to exceed amount
provided for in paragraph 4A above.

D. The CITY shall make periodic payments to the CROSSING GUARD
PROVIDER based upon services rendered within thirty (30) days after receipt
and approval of invoice. Said periodic payments to the CROSSING GUARD
PROVIDER shall not exceed the amounts shown in the following schedule, and
full payments for each task shall not be made until the task is completed and
accepted by the CHIEF OF POLICE.

4. PAYMENTS TO THE CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER (Monthly Method)

A. The CITY shall reimburse the CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER for services
under this Agreement a monthly sum of   Dollars, regardless of actual
Costs incurred by the CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER unless substantial
modifications to the AGREEMENT are authorized in writing by the CHIEF OF
POLICE.

B. The CITY shall make periodic payments to the CROSSING GUARD
PROVIDER based upon actual services within thirty (30) days after receipt and
approval of invoice. Said periodic payments to the CROSSING GUARD
PROVIDER shall not exceed the amounts shown in this agreement.

5. INVOICES

A. The CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER shall submit invoices in a format
approved by the CITY.
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B. The CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER shall maintain records showing actual 

time devoted and cost incurred. The CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER shall 
permit the authorized representative of the CITY to inspect and audit all data and 
records of the CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER for work done under this 
Agreement. The CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER shall make these records 
available at reasonable times during the Agreement period and for one (1) year 
after termination of this Agreement. 

 
6. TERMINATION OF AGREEMENT 

 

Notwithstanding any other provision hereof, the CITY may terminate this Agreement at 
any time upon fifteen (15) days prior written notice to the CROSSING GUARD 
PROVIDER. In the event that this Agreement is so terminated, the CROSSING GUARD 
PROVIDER shall be paid for services actually performed and reimbursable expenses 
actually incurred prior to termination, except that reimbursement shall not exceed the 
task amounts set forth under Paragraph 4 above. 

 
7. TERM 

 

This Agreement shall become effective as of the date the CROSSING GUARD 
PROVIDER is given a notice to proceed and, unless terminated for cause or pursuant to 
Paragraph 6, shall be deemed concluded on the date the CITY determines that all of the 
CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER’s work under this Agreement is completed. A 
determination of completion shall not constitute a waiver of any rights or claims which 
the CITY may have or thereafter acquire with respect to any term or provision of this 
Agreement. 

 
 

8. NOTICE OF CLAIM 
 

If the CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER wishes to make a claim for additional 
compensation as a result of action taken by the CITY, the CROSSING GUARD 
PROVIDER shall give written notice of their claim within fifteen (15) days after 
occurrence of such action. No claim for additional compensation shall be valid unless so 
made. Any changes in the CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER’s fee shall be valid only 
to the extent that such changes are included in writing signed by the CITY and the 
CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER. Regardless of the decision of the CHIEF OF 
POLICE relative to a claim submitted by the CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER, all 
work required under this Agreement as determined by the CHIEF OF POLICE shall 
proceed without interruption. 

 
9. BREACH OF CONTRACT 

 

If either party violates or breaches any term of this Agreement, such violation or breach 
shall be deemed to constitute a default, and the other party has the right to seek such 
administrative, contractual or legal remedies as may be suitable to the violation or 
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breach; and, in addition, if either party, by reason of any default, fails within fifteen (15) 
days after notice thereof by the other party to comply with the conditions of the 
Agreement, the other party may terminate this Agreement. Notwithstanding the 
foregoing, or anything else to the contrary in this Agreement, with the sole exception of 
an action to recover the monies the CITY has agreed to pay to the CROSSING GUARD 
PROVIDER pursuant to Paragraph 4 hereof, no action shall be commenced by the 
CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER against the CITY for monetary damages. 
CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER hereby further waives any and all claims or rights to 
interest on money claimed to be due pursuant to this Agreement and waives any and all 
such rights to interest which it claims it may otherwise be entitled pursuant to law, 
including, but not limited to, the Local Government Prompt Payment Act (50 ILCS 
501/1, et seq.), as amended, or the Illinois Interest Act (815 ILCS 205/1, et seq.), as 
amended. The parties hereto further agree that any action by the CROSSING GUARD 
PROVIDER arising out of this Agreement must be filed within one year of the date the 
alleged cause of action arose or the same will be time-barred. The provisions of this 
paragraph shall survive any expiration, completion and/or termination of this 
Agreement. 

 
10. INDEMNIFICATION 

 

To the fullest extent permitted by law, CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER agrees to and 
shall indemnify, defend and hold harmless the CITY, its officers, employees, agents, 
boards and commissions from and against any and all claims, suits, judgments, costs, 
attorneys fees, damages or other relief, including, but not limited to, workers’ 
compensation claims, in any way resulting from or arising out of negligent actions or 
omissions of the CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER in connection herewith, including 
negligence or omissions of employees or agents of the CROSSING GUARD 
PROVIDER arising out of the performance of this Agreement. In the event of any action 
against the CITY, its officers, employees, agents, boards or commissions, covered by 
the foregoing duty to indemnify, defend and hold harmless such action shall be defended 
by legal counsel of the CITY’s choosing. The provisions of this paragraph shall survive 
any expiration, completion and/or termination of this Agreement. 

 
 

11. NO PERSONAL LIABILITY 
 

No official, CHIEF OF POLICE, officer, agent or employee of the CITY shall be 
charged personally or held contractually liable under any term or provision of this 
Agreement or because of their execution, approval or attempted execution of this 
Agreement. 

 
12. INSURANCE 

 

CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER shall provide, maintain and pay for during the term 
of this Agreement the following types and amounts of insurance: 
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A. Comprehensive Liability and Workers Compensation. A policy of 
comprehensive general liability insurance with limits of at least $1,000,000 
aggregate for bodily injury and $1,000,000 aggregate for property damage per 
occurrence, which insurance must include, without limitation, protection for all 
activities associated with the service. 

 
The CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER shall deliver to the CHIEF OF POLICE 
a Certificate of Insurance naming the CITY as additional insured. The policy 
shall not be modified or terminated without thirty (30) days prior written notice 
to the CHIEF OF POLICE. 

 
The Certificate of Insurance shall include the contractual obligation assumed by 
the CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER under Paragraph 10 entitled 
“Indemnification”. 

 
This insurance shall be primary and non-contributory to any other insurance or 
self- insurance programs afforded to the CITY. There shall be no endorsement 
or modification of this insurance to make it excess over other available insurance. 

 
B. Umbrella Excess Liability Coverage. No less than 2,000,000 over primary 

insurance, worker’s compensation, and general liability should be scheduled 
under the umbrella. The CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER shall cause the City 
to be named as an additional insured on the insurance policy. 

 
C. Professional Liability. The CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER shall carry 

CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER’s Professional Liability Insurance covering 
claims resulting from error, omissions or negligent acts with a combined single 
limit of not less than $1,000,000 per claim. A Certificate of Insurance shall be 
submitted to the CHIEF OF POLICE as evidence of insurance protection. The 
policy shall not be modified or terminated without thirty 
(30) days prior written notice to the CHIEF OF POLICE. 

 
 

13. NONDISCRIMINATION/AFFIRMATIVE ACTION 
 

The CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER will not discriminate against any employee or 
applicant for employment because of race, color, religion, sex, national origin, age, 
ancestry, order of protection status, familial status, marital status, physical or mental 
disability, military status, sexual orientation, or unfavorable discharge from military 
service which would not interfere with the efficient performance of the job in question.  

 
No person shall be denied or subjected to discrimination in receipt of the benefit of any 
services or activities made possible by or resulting from this Agreement on the grounds 
of race, color, religion, sex, national origin, age, ancestry, order of protection status, 
familial status, marital status, physical or mental disability, military status, sexual 
orientation, or unfavorable discharge from military service. 
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Any violation of this paragraph shall be considered a violation of a material provision of 
this Agreement and shall be grounds for cancellation, termination or suspension, in 
whole or in part, of the Agreement by the CITY. 

 
 

14. ASSIGNMENT AND SUCCESSORS 
 

This Agreement and each and every portion thereof shall be binding upon the successors 
and the assigns of the parties hereto; provided, however, that no assignment shall be made 
without the prior written consent of the CITY. 

 
 

15. DELEGATIONS AND SUBCONTRACTORS 
 

Any assignment, delegation or subcontracting shall be subject to all the terms, conditions 
and other provisions of this Agreement and the CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER shall 
remain liable to the CITY with respect to each and every item, condition and other 
provision hereof to the same extent that the CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER would 
have been obligated if it had done the work itself and no assignment, delegation or 
subcontract had been made. Any proposed subcontractor shall require the CITY’s 
advanced written approval. 

 
 

16. NO CO-PARTNERSHIP OR AGENCY 
 

This Agreement shall not be construed so as to create a partnership, joint venture, 
employment or other agency relationship between the parties hereto. 

 
17. SEVERABILITY 

 

The parties intend and agree that, if any paragraph, sub-paragraph, phrase, clause or 
other provision of this Agreement, or any portion thereof, shall be held to be void or 
otherwise unenforceable, all other portions of this Agreement shall remain in full force 
and effect. 

 
18. HEADINGS 

 

The headings of the several paragraphs of this Agreement are inserted only as a matter 
of convenience and for reference and in no way are they intended to define, limit or 
describe the scope of intent of any provision of this Agreement, nor shall they be 
construed to affect in any manner the terms and provisions hereof or the interpretation or 
construction thereof. 

 
19. MODIFICATION OR AMENDMENT 

 

This Agreement and its attachments constitute the entire Agreement of the parties on the 
subject matter hereof and may not be changed, modified, discharged or extended except 
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by written amendment duly executed by the parties. Each party agrees that no 
representations or warranties shall be binding upon the other party unless expressed in 
writing herein or in a duly executed amendment hereof, or change order as herein 
provided. 

 
20. APPLICABLE LAW 

 

This Agreement shall be deemed to have been made in and shall be construed in 
accordance with the laws of the State of Illinois. Venue for the resolution of any disputes 
or the enforcement of any rights pursuant to this Agreement shall be in the Circuit Court 
of Kane County, Illinois. 

 
21. NEWS RELEASES 

 

The CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER may not issue any news releases without prior 
approval from the CHIEF OF POLICE, nor will the CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER 
make public proposals developed under this Agreement without prior written approval 
from the CHIEF OF POLICE prior to said documentation becoming matters of public 
record. 

 

22. COOPERATION WITH OTHER CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER 

 
The CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER shall cooperate with any other CROSSING 

GUARD PROVIDERs in the CITY’s employ or any work associated with the 
AGREEMENT. 

 
provided 

 
 

23. INTERFERENCE WITH PUBLIC CONTRACTING 
 

The CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER certifies hereby that it is not barred from bidding 
on this contract as a result of a violation of 720 ILCS 5/33E et seq. or any similar state 
or federal statute regarding bid rigging. 
 

24. SEXUAL HARASSMENT 
 

As a condition of this contract, the CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER shall have 
written sexual harassment policies that include, at a minimum, the following 
information: 

 
A. the illegality of sexual harassment; 

 
B. the definition of sexual harassment under state law; 
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C. a description of sexual harassment, utilizing examples; 

 
D. the vendor’s internal complaint process including penalties; 

 
E. the legal recourse, investigative and complaint process available through the 

Illinois Department of Human Rights, and the Illinois Human Rights 
Commission; 

 
F. directions on how to contact the department and commission; 

 
G. protection against retaliation as provided by Section 6-101 of the Human 

Rights Act. 
 

A copy of the policies shall be provided by CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER to the 
Department of Human Rights upon request (775 ILCS 5/2-105). 
 
 

25. SUBSTANCE ABUSE PROGRAM. 
 

As a condition of this agreement, CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER shall have in place 
a written substance abuse prevention program.  A copy of such policy shall be provided 
to the City’s Assistant City Manager prior to the entry into and execution of this 
agreement. 
 

26. WRITTEN COMMUNICATIONS 
 

All recommendations and other communications by the CROSSING GUARD 
PROVIDER to the CHIEF OF POLICE and to other participants which may affect cost 
or time of completion, shall be made or confirmed in writing. The CHIEF OF POLICE 
may also require other recommendations and communications by the CROSSING 
GUARD PROVIDER be made or confirmed in writing. 

 
27. NOTICES 

 

All notices, reports and documents required under this Agreement shall be in writing 
and shall be mailed by First Class Mail, postage prepaid, addressed as follows: 

 
H. As to the CITY: 

 
 
 

City of Geneva 
C/O CHIEF OF POLICE 
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22 S First Street 
Geneva, IL  60134 

 
 

I. As to the CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER: 
 
 
 
 
 

28. COMPLIANCE WITH LAWS 
 

Notwithstanding any other provision of this Agreement, it is expressly agreed and 
understood that in connection with the performance of this Agreement that the 
CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER shall comply with all applicable federal, state, city and 
other requirements of law, including, but not limited to, any applicable requirements 
regarding prevailing wages, minimum wage, workplace safety and legal status of 
employees. Without limiting the foregoing, CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER hereby 
certifies, represents and warrants to the CITY that all CROSSING GUARD 
PROVIDER’s employees and/or agents who will be providing products and/or services 
with respect to this Agreement shall be legally authorized to work in the United States. 
CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER shall also at its expense secure all permits and 
licenses, pay all charges and fees and give all notices necessary and incident to the due 
and lawful prosecution of the work, and/or the products and/or services to be provided 
for in this Agreement. The CITY shall have the right to audit any records in the possession 
or control of the CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER to determine CROSSING GUARD 
PROVIDER’s compliance with the provisions of this paragraph. In the event the CITY 
proceeds with such an audit the CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER shall make available 
to the CITY the CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER’s relevant records at no cost to the 
CITY. CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER shall pay any and all costs associated with 
any such audit. 
 

29. COUNTERPARTS AND EXECUTION: 
 
 

This Agreement may be executed in counterparts, each of which shall be an original and 
all of which shall constitute one and the same agreement. This Agreement may be 
executed electronically, and any signed copy of this Agreement transmitted by facsimile 
machine or email shall be treated in all manners and respects as an original document. 
The signature of any party on a copy of this Agreement transmitted by facsimile machine 
or email shall be considered for these purposes an original signature and shall have the 
same legal effect as an original signature. 

 
IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have entered into and executed this 

Agreement effective as of the date and year first written above. 
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CITY OF GENEVA: 
 
By:    

Stephanie K. Dawkins, City Administrator 
 
 
Attest: 

 
 
City Clerk 

 
 
 
CROSSING GUARD PROVIDER: 

 
 
 

By:  Name/Print:  Title:    
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